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The publication is devoted to the re-
search of property rights of spouses. The 
property relationships between wife and 
husband are described in this article. 

The purpose of this research is to an-
alyze the certain types of objects of joint 
property of spouses.

The object of this research is family 
relationships between wife and husband 
in the civil law of Ukraine.

The subject of this research are: in-
ternational acts, legal acts of Ukraine 
and foreign countries and their practical 
application, scientific views, ideas and 
concepts of domestic and foreign schol-
ars in the field of property relationships 
between spouses.

Methodological basis of the research 
consists of the following methods: legal 
comparative method; dialectical method; 

formal and logical methods; systemic 
and structural methods etc.

It should be noted, that issues of 
ownership of spouses are extremely im-
portant under present conditions.

By the general rule, marriage is the ba-
sis for the emergence of joint ownership 
property of spouses. However, irrespective 
of the marriage, each spouse may have a 
property which belongs to him personally.

Problems of determining the property 
as joint property of the spouses are ana-
lyzed in this article. 

Certain types of property, which is 
wife’s and husband’s personal private 
property, are studied in this article.

The possibility of determination of 
private company property and individual 
entrepreneurs’ property as joint property 
of spouses is analyzed. 


